

COLE COUNTY BID NO. 2018-21

**FLOORING REPLACEMENT**

BID OPENING: 3/29/2018

BID AWARD: 4/10/2018

Allen Floors <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>	Beautiful Home Interiors <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>	Scruggs <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>
---	---	--------------------------------------

PROJECT ONE: EMERGENCY SERVICES BUILDING			
A. CARPETED OFFICES, VINYL PLANK COMMON AREAS/RESTROOMS	\$16,659.00	\$11,744.00	\$11,325.00
B. CARPETED OFFICES, VINYL PLANK <u>ALTERNATE</u> COMMON AREAS/RESTROOMS	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,620.00
VINYL PRODUCT:	Mohawk LTV Living Local	Mohawk Aladdin Barrali/AH011	Shaw Terrain 0564V
ALTERNATE TO VINYL PRODUCT:	N/A	N/A	Shaw In the Grain II Exoguard Plus
PROJECT TWO: (NEW) HEALTH DEPARTMENT			
C. CARPETED OFFICES, VINYL PLANK COMMON AREAS/RESTROOMS (plus six extra boxes)	\$102,140.00	\$81,375.00	\$80,579.00
D. VINYL PLANK THROUGHOUT	\$100,453.00	\$78,490.00	\$80,357.00
E. CARPETED OFFICES, VINYL PLANK <u>ALTERNATE</u> COMMON AREAS/RESTROOMS (plus six extra boxes)	\$0.00	NO BID	\$83,895.00
F. VINYL PLANK <u>ALTERNATE</u> THROUGHOUT	\$0.00	NO BID	\$84,465.00
VINYL PRODUCT:	Mohawk LTV Living Local	Mohawk Aladdin Barrali/AH011	Shaw Terrain 0564V
ALTERNATE TO VINYL PRODUCT:	N/A	N/A	In the Grain II-20 mil Exoguard Plus
PROJECT THREE: EMS DISPATCH			
G. CARPETED OFFICE	\$2,327.00	\$988.00	\$1,415.00
ADD/DEDUCT PRICING PER SQUARE FOOT			
CARPET	\$3.14	\$3.43	\$3.79
VINYL PLANKS	\$3.46	\$2.20	\$4.85
VINYL PLANK ALTERNATE	N/A	N/A	N/A
TOTAL COST, COMBINED PROJECT OPTIONS			
A, C & G	\$121,126.00	\$94,107.00	\$93,319.00
B, C & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$93,614.00
A, D & G	\$119,439.00	\$91,222.00	\$93,097.00
B, D & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$93,392.00
A, E & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$96,635.00
B, E & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$96,930.00
A, F & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$97,205.00
B, F & G	NO BID	NO BID	\$97,500.00
WARRANTY			
	10-YEAR	10-YEAR	10-YEAR; LIFETIME ON ALT