

2017-14: INMATE WELFARE ITEMS

DESCRIPTION	EAU	AMER. INSTIT'L SUPPLY <i>Glen Cove, NY</i>		AMERCARE PRODUCTS <i>Woodinville, WA</i>		BOB BARKER <i>Fuquay-Varina, NC</i>		CHARM-TEX <i>Brooklyn, NY</i>		HR COTTON USA <i>Lawrence GA</i>		ICS JAIL SUPPLIES <i>Waco, TX</i>		OD TARAGIN & BROS <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		TABB TEXTILES <i>Opelika, AL</i>		UNIFORMS MFG <i>Scottsdale, AZ</i>	
		Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order	Cost Ea.	Min Order
1 BAR BODY SOAP	39,000	\$0.03	100	\$0.04	Order minimum \$1,000	\$0.04	1,000	\$0.03	5,000	NO BID	\$0.04	1,000	NO BID	N/A	NO BID	NO BID	N/A		
2 TOOTHPASTE	7,800	\$0.13	144	\$0.12		\$0.15	144	\$0.12	2,880		\$0.16	144	NO BID	N/A		NO BID	N/A		
3 TOOTHBRUSH	7,800	\$0.03	144	\$0.08		\$0.04	144	\$0.04	2,880		\$0.04	144	NO BID	N/A		NO BID	N/A		
4 DISPOSABLE RAZOR	7,800	\$0.05	100	\$0.08		\$0.05	600	\$0.05	4,000		\$0.06	2,000	NO BID	N/A		NO BID	N/A		
5 MENS BOXER SHORTS (AVERAGE)	720	\$1.39	12	NO BID	\$1.32	\$12.00	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.52		5 doz mixed	\$1.54	12	\$1.53	\$12.00				
Small		\$1.28	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.44		5 doz mixed	\$1.46	12	\$1.47	12				
Medium		\$1.28	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.44		5 doz mixed	\$1.46	12	\$1.47	12				
Large		\$1.28	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.44		5 doz mixed	\$1.46	12	\$1.47	12				
X-Large		\$1.28	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.44		5 doz mixed	\$1.46	12	\$1.47	12				
2X-Large		\$1.43	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.52		5 doz mixed	\$1.55	12	\$1.59	12				
3X-Large		\$1.54	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.64		5 doz mixed	\$1.64	12	\$1.59	12				
4X-Large		\$1.64	12		\$1.32	12	\$1.41	Unknown	\$1.75		5 doz mixed	\$1.73	12	\$1.64	12				
6 LADIES PANTIES (AVERAGE)	288	\$1.12	12		\$0.80	12	\$0.90	Unknown	\$1.13	5 doz mixed	\$1.55	12	\$1.23	12					
Small (5-7)		\$0.95	12		\$0.80	12	\$0.80	Unknown	\$1.03	5 doz mixed	\$1.35	12	\$0.97	12					
Medium (8-10)		\$1.05	12		\$0.80	12	\$0.80	Unknown	\$1.08	5 doz mixed	\$1.52	12	\$0.97	12					
Large (11-14)		\$1.18	12		\$0.80	12	\$0.99	Unknown	\$1.18	5 doz mixed	\$1.61	12	\$0.97	12					
Plus Size (15 up)		\$1.28	12	NO BID	N/A	\$0.99	Unknown	\$1.24	5 doz mixed	\$1.70	12	\$2.00	12						
7 SPORTS BRA (AVERAGE)	288	\$1.99	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.48	5 doz mixed	\$2.46	12	\$1.57	12						
Small (32)		\$1.89	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.34	5 doz mixed	\$2.26	12	\$1.57	12						
Medium (34)		\$1.89	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.34	5 doz mixed	\$2.26	12	\$1.57	12						
Large (36)		\$1.89	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.34	5 doz mixed	\$2.26	12	\$1.57	12						
X-Large (38)		\$1.89	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.34	5 doz mixed	\$2.26	12	\$1.57	12						
2X-Large (≥40)		\$1.89	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.35	5 doz mixed	\$2.44	12	\$1.57	12						
3X-Large (≥44)		\$2.08	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.35	5 doz mixed	\$2.62	12	\$1.57	12						
4X-Large (≥48)		\$2.08	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.89	5 doz mixed	\$2.62	12	\$1.57	12						
5X-Large (≥50)		\$2.28	12	\$1.49	12	\$1.72	Unknown	\$2.89	5 doz mixed	\$2.99	12	\$1.57	12						
8 TUBE SOCKS	720	\$0.79	1	\$0.49	12	\$0.50	240	\$0.56	60	\$0.71	12	\$0.51	12						
9 INMATE SHOES		\$4.90	1 pair	\$2.08	1 pair	\$3.90	120 pair	\$2.50	24	\$5.91	12	NO BID	N/A						
10 MENS T-SHIRT, ORANGE (AVERAGE)	240	\$2.60	12	NO BID	\$2.24	12	\$3.06	Unknown	\$3.72	5 doz mixed	\$2.54	220	\$2.51	12					
Small		\$2.20	12		NO BID	N/A	\$2.72	Unknown	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.68	220	\$2.40	12					
Medium		\$2.20	12		\$2.24	12	\$2.72	Unknown	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.68	220	\$2.40	12					
Large		\$2.20	12		\$2.24	12	\$2.72	Unknown	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.68	220	\$2.40	12					
X-Large		\$2.20	12		\$2.24	12	\$2.72	Unknown	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.68	220	\$2.40	12					
2X-Large		\$2.40	12		\$2.24	12	\$3.26	Unknown	\$3.71	5 doz mixed	\$3.21	220	\$2.50	12					
3X-Large		\$3.40	12		\$2.24	12	\$3.54	Unknown	\$3.96	5 doz mixed	\$3.91	220	\$2.50	12					
4X-Large		\$3.60	12		\$2.24	12	\$3.72	Unknown	\$4.39	5 doz mixed	\$3.91	220	\$3.00	12					
11 MENS T-SHIRT, KHAKI (AVERAGE)	120	\$2.60	12		\$2.82	1	\$3.76	72	\$3.72	5 doz mixed	\$2.86	220	\$3.07	12					
Small		\$2.20	12		\$2.16	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.98	220	\$2.75	12					
Medium		\$2.20	12		\$2.16	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.98	220	\$2.75	12					
Large		\$2.20	12		\$2.16	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.98	220	\$2.75	12					
X-Large		\$2.20	12	\$2.16	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	5 doz mixed	\$1.98	220	\$2.75	12						
2X-Large		\$2.40	12	\$3.70	1	\$4.90	72	\$3.71	5 doz mixed	\$3.48	220	\$3.25	12						
3X-Large		\$3.40	12	\$3.70	1	\$4.90	72	\$3.96	5 doz mixed	\$4.26	220	\$3.25	12						
4X-Large		\$3.60	12	\$3.70	1	\$4.90	72	\$4.39	5 doz mixed	\$4.35	220	\$4.00	12						
12 WOMENS T-SHIRT, SAFETY GREEN (AVERAGE)		\$2.60	12	\$3.84	1	\$3.76	72	\$3.72	10 doz mixed	\$2.86	220	\$4.06	Unknown						
Small		\$2.20	12	\$2.98	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	10 doz mixed	\$2.06	220	\$3.99	Unknown						
Medium		\$2.20	12	\$2.98	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	10 doz mixed	\$2.06	220	\$3.99	Unknown						
Large		\$2.20	12	\$2.98	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	10 doz mixed	\$2.06	220	\$3.99	Unknown						
X-Large		\$2.20	12	\$2.98	1	\$2.90	72	\$3.50	10 doz mixed	\$2.06	220	\$3.99	Unknown						
2X-Large		\$2.40	12	\$4.98	1	\$4.90	72	\$3.71	10 doz mixed	\$3.43	220	\$3.99	Unknown						
3X-Large		\$3.40	12	\$4.98	1	\$4.90	72	\$3.96	10 doz mixed	\$3.98	220	\$4.25	Unknown						
4X-Large		\$3.60	12	\$4.98	1	\$4.90	72	\$4.39	10 doz mixed	\$4.35	220	\$4.25	Unknown						

13	MENS UNIFORM SHIRT, ORANGE (AVERAGE)	240			\$4.88	1	\$5.62	100			\$9.26	24 each	\$6.70	24			\$4.59	12
	Small				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	Medium				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	2X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	3X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.72	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.87	24			\$4.90	12
	4X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$7.03	24			\$5.10	12
14	MENS UNIFORM SHIRT, KHAKI (AVERAGE)	120			\$4.88	1	\$5.62	100			\$9.26	24 each	\$6.70	24			\$4.59	12
	Small				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	Medium				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	2X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$4.42	12
	3X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.72	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.87	24			\$4.90	12
	4X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$7.03	24			\$5.10	12
15	WOMENS UNIFORM SHIRT, SAFETY GREEN (AVERAGE)	120			\$4.88	1	\$5.62	100			\$9.26	24 each	\$6.70	24			\$5.04	Unknown
	Small				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$5.00	Unknown
	Medium				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$5.00	Unknown
	Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$5.00	Unknown
	X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$8.90	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$5.00	Unknown
	2X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.54	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.60	24			\$5.00	Unknown
	3X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.72	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$6.87	24			\$5.10	Unknown
	4X-Large				\$4.88	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.75	24 each	\$7.03	24			\$5.20	Unknown
16	SHIRT STENCILING (PER LETTER)				\$0.59	1	\$0.18	100			\$0.00	24	\$1.15/\$1.80	144/1			\$0.40	12
17	MENS UNIFORM TROUSERS, ORANGE (AVERAGE)	240			\$5.95	1	\$6.03	100			\$9.19	24 each	\$6.96	24			\$5.76	12
	Small				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	Medium				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	Large				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	X-Large				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	2X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	3X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.18	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.44	24			\$6.00	12
	4X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.54	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.81	24			\$6.10	12
18	MENS UNIFORM TROUSERS, KHAKI (AVERAGE)	120			\$5.95	1	\$6.03	100			\$9.19	24 each	\$6.96	24			\$5.76	12
	Small				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	Medium				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	Large				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	X-Large				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	2X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$5.65	12
	3X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.18	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.44	24			\$6.00	12
	4X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.54	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.81	24			\$6.10	12
19	WOMENS UNIFORM TROUSERS, SAFETY GREEN (AVERAGE)	120			\$5.96	1	\$6.03	100			\$9.19	24 each	\$6.96	24			\$6.04	12
	Small				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$6.00	12
	Medium				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$6.00	12
	Large				\$5.89	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$6.00	12
	X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$5.90	100			\$8.80	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$6.00	12
	2X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$5.90	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$6.69	24			\$6.00	12
	3X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.18	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.44	24			\$6.15	12
	4X-Large				\$6.02	1	\$6.54	100			\$9.70	24 each	\$7.81	24			\$6.15	12
20	TROUSER STENCILING (PER LETTER)				\$0.59	1	\$0.18	200			\$0.00	24 each	\$1.15/\$1.80	144/1			\$0.40	12
21	FLAT SHEET	3,500	\$3.45	12	\$2.16	12	\$2.18	600	\$2.55	60	\$2.50	12	\$4.26	120	\$2.25	240	\$2.84	60
22	WOOL BLANKET		\$11.28	12	\$7.14	1	\$4.26	96	NO BID	N/A	\$7.50	40	\$11.50	1	\$4.85	180	NO BID	N/A
23	NON-WOOL BLANKET		\$7.20	12	\$6.15	1	\$6.18	96	\$5.95	10	\$7.50	25	\$7.17	1	\$5.90	192	\$7.59	24
24	BATH TOWEL	3,500	\$1.25	12	\$1.07	12	\$1.08	300	\$1.12	120	\$1.42	36	\$16.02	1	\$0.98	300	\$1.26	300
25	WASHCLOTH	3,500	\$0.15	12	\$0.14	12	\$0.14	1,200	\$0.15	300	\$0.17	120	\$0.98	1	\$0.14	1,200	\$0.16	1,200
26	LAUNDRY NET BAG	48	\$2.94	12	\$2.32	12	\$2.36	120	NO BID	N/A	\$3.99	36	\$7.40	1	NO BID	N/A	\$2.60	120

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING?
MAX DELIVERY 4 WKS?

YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES

* Item 6 up to size 16

* Item 6, largest size is 11